
Michael Dales is the Project Manager at
RHA Ventures, where he has spent the last
seven years managing new venture intake
and working with early-stage companies.
Growing up in an ag tech business
founding family, Michael started his own
video and social media production
company. While completing his Honours
Bachelor of Commerce in Management, he
was part of the original founding group of
RHA Ventures, learning from another
startup adventure.

RHA Ventures focuses on growing the next
generation of leading companies. It
employs a "Founders for Founders"
approach, providing strategic investment,
mentoring, and leveraging experience,
skills, networks, and domain expertise to
increase the probability of success and
accelerate growth. During Michael’s tenure
at RHA Ventures, they have made over 40
investments in early-stage companies, met
with hundreds of potential companies, and
reviewed over a thousand pitch decks.
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